
BIDDERS TOTAL

1.  The Okonite Company 2,073,930.00$

2.  DRAKA -aka-  Prysmian Group $ 2,153, 980.00

3.  Anixter Inc. 3,177,250.00$

4.  M&F Concrete, Inc. 4,085,550.00$
 NO-BID

BIDDERS TOTAL

1.  DRAKA -aka-  Prysmian Group 633,650.00$

2.  The Okonite Company 637,625.00$

3.  Anixter Inc. 839,900.00$

4. M&F Concrete, Inc. 966,400.00$
 NO-BID

BIDDERS TOTAL
1. Anixter Inc. 858,200.00$
2. M&F Concrete, Inc. 986,925.00$
3. The Okonite Company 1,108,622.50$
4. DRAKA -aka-  Prysmian Group  NO-BID

 NO-BID

BIDDER TOTAL

1.  The Okonite Company 329,602.50$

BIDDERS TOTAL
1. DRAKA -aka-  Prysmian Group $ 3,226,060.00
2. WESCO International 5,915,030.80$
3. Resitech Industries, LLC 16,499,522.00$
4. Anixter, Inc. 31,228,000.00$
5. M&F Concrete, Inc. 35,955,000.00$
6. The Okonite Company  NO-BID

CATEGORY ( D )  "ATC CABLES"

No bid Pricing - Line #61

CATEGORY ( E )  "FIBER OPTIC CABLES"

Sole Source Procurement / which can commence Negotiations

CATEGORY ( C )  "ALS CABLES"

          TOTAL:  6 BIDDERSCONTRACT TERM:  5 YEARS (From NTP Date)

 (5)  Resitech     &   (6)  Wesco International

 (5)  Resitech     &   (6)  Wesco International

 (5)  Resitech     &   (6)  Wesco International

CATEGORY ( B )  "POWER CABLES"

BID NO.   IFB  #FQ18050       BID OPENING DATE: Wed.   March 28, 2018

CABLE SUPPLY - IDIQ
Indefinite Delivery / Indefinite Quantity

CATEGORY ( A )  "TRACTION POWER"

WMATA - JGB 
600 Fixth Street, NW  -  Washington, DC  20001

Margarita Rodriguez 
Contract Administrator 
Procurement & Materials - Construction

Digitally signed by Margarita Rodriguez E024312 
WMATA DN: c=US, o=Washington Metropolitan Area 
Transit Authority, ou=People, cn=Margarita Rodriguez 
E024312 WMATA 
Reason: I attest to the accuracy and integrity of this 
document 
Location: WMATA -JGB - 4th Floor  (#403A) 
Date: 2018.04.01 15:04:53 -04'00'











MULTI-CONDUCTOR "ATC" CABLE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED TOTAL

53 2/C #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
54 5/C #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
55 10/C #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
56 9/C #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
57 27/C# 14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
58 37/C #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
59 40/C #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
60 3/C #10 +10/c #14  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
61 50pr #19 7W TC (DTS Cable)  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  
62 1/C #10  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  

63 1/C #6  Section 32 42 49 2,500 LF -$                 -$  

COMPANY:
ADDRESS:

(Print Name/Title)

CATEGORY (D)

CATEGORY (D)

BASES FOR AWARD

FQ18050  CABLE SUPPLY

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:

Price Schedule

CATEGORY D  "ATC Signal Cables" (Line Items 53 thru 63)  TOTAL: $ . =          $ _____________

(Unit price "MUST" be entered on each line item) 

PRICE SCHEDULE SHEET 
(Page 2 of 3)

WASHINGTON METROPOLITAN AREA TRANSIT AUTHORITY 
Contract No.:  FQ18050                  SUPPLY AND SERVICE CONTRACT (IDIQ)  March 5, 2018 

6

NOTE:   

Category D 

NOT AWARDED




